CEW&SA Surplus Sale Bid Day #1 - PS2024-14 11/14/24 10:00 AM

Lot #|Description Minimum Bid Maximum Bid

1 |2001 Dodge 3500 (VIN#1441) $20,000.00 No Bid
2 |2003 Freightliner Dump Truck (VIN#2746) $30,000.00 $3 4’25 5.00
3 |2003 Freightliner Service Body (VIN#2745) $25,000.00 $ 2 5’ 000.00
4 12016 Ford F350 Service Body (VIN#9774) $19,500.00 No Bid
5 |2019 RAM 1500 (VIN#6223) $15,000.00

$18,626.00
6 |2021 Ford F150 (VIN#0513) $30,000.00 No Bid
7 2021 Ford F150 (VIN#0512) $32,000.00 No Bid
8 |1992 Interstate Trailer 18DT (VIN#0072) $1,000.00 S 1’ 621.00
9 |1999 Case 75XT Skid Steer $15,000.00 No Bid
10 [SullAir Rotary Screw Air Compressor $20,000.00 No Bld
11 |2007 Massey Ferguson Tractor $7,500.00 $10'000.00
12 |18” HDPE SDR 17 Pipe $5,000.00 No Bid
13 |24"” Split Steel Casing $3,800.00 No Bid
14 |Marco Sandblaster $2,500.00 $3’250.00
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