CEW&SA Surplus Sale Bid Day #2 - PS2024-21 11/21/24 10:00 AM

Lot # |Description Minimum Bid Maximum Bid
15 |1997 GMC Topkick Dump Truck (VIN#2651) $12,000.00 No Bld
16 |2007 International Dump Truck (VIN#7546) $30,000.00 $31 000.00
N .
17 2003 Freightliner Service Body (VIN#3672) $25,000.00 No Bid
18 [2022 Ford F250 Service Body (VIN#6767) $45,000.00 No Bid
19 |2021 Ford F150 (VIN#0516) $30,000.00 .
‘ No Bid
20 |2021 Ford F150 (VIN#0514) $35,000.00 No Bid
21 |2021 Ford F150 (VIN#0517) $32,000.00 NO Bid
22 |1991 Interstate Trailer (VIN#2954) $1,000.00 SZ 000.00
’ L]
23 |1997 Case 590-SL Backhoe $15,500.00 NO Bid
24 12008 JCB Telehandler Loader $15,000.00 $17 000.00
’ L
25 |2011 Konica Printer/Copier/Fax $500.00 $551 00
26 |Office Chairs (Blue Cloth) and Table $50.00 No Bid
27 |Ingersoll Rand Air Compressor $2,500.00 $2 500.00
’ i
28 |LeeBoy Tack Distributor Trailer $7,500.00 No Bid
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